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Flexible. Adaptable. Fluid.

The open plan is in a constant state of change. Whether designing for 
free-address mobility or assigned benching, open collaboration or private, 
heads-down work, Flux Open Plan brings order to the unrest. 

Designed by David Allan Pesso, Flux Open Plan is an extension of the 
Flux casegood line that adapts to the way you work with an extensive 
offering of height adjustability, smart storage, and modern materials. 

Create straight rows of benching or a more dynamic layout with 120° 
tables. Sit-to-stand in a variety of ways; whether integrated into casegoods, 
supported by an H-frame, or simple freestanding tables. A center rail 
between two Flux worksurfaces holds suspended power units and wire 
baskets. Privacy panels can be added above the surface, either mounted in 
the center rail or to the edge of height adjustable surfaces.

Flux storage lends a hand through credenzas, towers and pantry wardrobes. 
A wide variety of functional accessories can clamp to the table’s edge to 
keep clutter off the surface. Lockers offer a home for additional items away 
from the workstation and can create privacy between rows of benching.

Match your private offices to your open plan with a cohesive palette and 
aesthetic. Elevated casegoods on metal legs create a light scale, progressive 
look. Or keep it simple with on-the-floor casegoods. Flux’s material 
offering includes veneer and laminate, woodgrain or solid colors. Metal 
finishes include Arctic Silver, Soft Nickel, Pewter, and new to the offering: 
Matte Black.

Flux Open Plan is available to order - March 2019. Come see the flexibility 
and vast extent of Flux this NeoCon in the JSI showroom, space #3-111. 
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Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (1)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching with Storage 

& Privacy Screens

Materials 

Florence Walnut Laminate

Arctic Silver Metal

Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (2)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching with Storage 

& Privacy Hood

Materials 

Aged Ash Laminate

Matte Black Metal
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Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (3)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching with Pantry 

Storage

Materials 

Weathered Ash Laminate

Pewter Metal
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Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (4)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching with Privacy 

Support Panels

Materials 

Cremello Double Cut Veneer

Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (5)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching with Return 

Surface & Privacy Hood

Materials 

Mocha Walnut Veneer

Pewter Metal
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Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (6)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching with Storage 

& Privacy Screens

Materials 

Oatmeal Cookie Laminate

Arctic Silver Metal



JASPER GROUP BRANDS

THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION IS AVAILABLE 
FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE

MARCH 2019

PRESS RELEASE

JASPER GROUP BRANDS

Flux Open Plan

Contact 

Ashley Sendelweck 

Jasper Group Vice President of Marketing

ashley@jaspergroup.us.com 

Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (7)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching with 

Credenzas & Center Cabinets

Materials 

Pinnacle Walnut Laminate

Soft Nickel Metal

Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (8)

Photographed  

Fixed Height Benching 120° Surfaces

Materials 

Florence Walnut Laminate

Arctic Silver Metal
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Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (9)

Photographed  

Adjustable Height Benching with 

Mobile Pedestals

Materials 

Walnut Heights Laminate

Matte Black Metal
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Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (10)

Photographed  

Adjustable Height H-Frame Benching with 

Storage Towers & Privacy Screens

Materials 

Weathered Ash Laminate

Pewter Metal

Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (11)

Photographed  

Adjustable Height H-Frame Benching 

Materials 

Mocha Walnut Veneer

Arctic Silver Metal
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Image Specifications

Name  

JSI_Flux_Open Plan (12)

Photographed  

Adjustable Height H-Frame Benching 

120° Surfaces

Materials 

Fossil Double Cut Veneer

Matte Black Metal


